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Bibliogov, United States, 2013. Paperback. Book Condition: New.
246 x 189 mm. Language: English . Brand New Book ***** Print
on Demand *****.The Senate Finance Committee, which is
expected to mark up a bill to reauthorize TANF in May, received
proposals for new TANF rules in early April. They include
requirements for financial education of recipients (S. 813) and
new due process and data collection rules (S. 770). Pending in
Committee are four comprehensive reauthorization bills: H.R. 4,
the House Republican leadership bill, passed by the House
February 13, S. 5, the Senate Republican leadership bill, and two
Democratic alternatives, S. 367, and S. 448. H.R. 4 is almost
identical to the bill passed by the House last year (H.R. 4737).
Both H.R. 4 and S. 5 set the work week for most TANF recipients
at 40 hours and require that states eventually engage 70 of
recipients in a work activity. S. 5 adds new anti-fraud rules, and
permits states to contract out the determination of food stamp
eligibility. Since the original program expired October 1, 2002,
TANF and related programs of mandatory child care,
transitional medicaid, and abstinence education have been
operating under temporary spending authority. P.L. 108-7
extended...
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